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Evolve Houston eMobility Grants: 

Round 3 Awardees 
 
In 2024, Evolve Houston awarded funding to 22 community-led projects through Round 3 of 

Evolve’s Grants Program (formerly the eMobility Microgrant Initiative). This program 

provides one-time grants of up to $15,000 to support innovative clean transportation 

solutions in historically underserved communities across Greater Houston. 

These projects are being implemented throughout 2025, driving meaningful progress on EV 

infrastructure, clean energy workforce training, community EV education, and sustainable 

mobility solutions that are shaping a cleaner, healthier, and more connected Houston. 

 

Round 3 eMobility Grant Winners: 

• Bullard Center for Environmental Justice – Trail Show on Tap: Electrifying the 

Path 
 
Deploying an electric utility vehicle to support eMobility education, service projects, 
and sustainability outreach at Texas Southern University and along the Columbia 
Tap Trail. 
 

• Bullard Center for Environmental Justice – Texas Southern University HBCU 

Environmental and Climate Justice 
 
Educating TSU students about e-bikes and e-scooters to promote sustainable 
commuting and air quality research. 
 

• Mina II Society Consulting – The Power in Sunnyside 

 
Hosting clean transportation workshops and outreach in Sunnyside, including EV 
education and e-bike giveaways to drive community engagement. 
 

• HYPE Freedom School – EV Literacy on the Lawn 

 
Youth-led EV education and service-learning project in Sunnyside culminating in a 
public community awareness event. 
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• Black Girls Do Engineer Corporation – EVolve Together: Empowering 

Communities 
 
Hosting community EV education workshops and STEM programs for youth to build 
interest in clean transportation careers. 
 

• Texas Southern University – TSU ITE-WTS Project Proposal 

 
Conducting EV transportation surveys, outreach, and education to raise community 
EV awareness and participation in the Third Ward. 
 

• Shawn Owens – Electric Eats 
 
Expanding a zero-carbon food delivery program in Third Ward using e-bikes to 
reduce food insecurity and promote green transportation careers. 

 

• Friends of Columbia Tap – Wheels of Change: Electric Dreams for Housing 

Justice 

 
Empowering Third Ward residents through educational comics, storytelling, and 
engagement campaigns on clean transportation and mobility justice. 

 

• University of Texas at Tyler – Alief EV Connect 

 
Providing EV charging installation and maintenance training for local college 
students to build clean energy career pathways. 

 

• Retrain America & Southwest Public Schools Main Campus – All Things PAT3 
 
Using drones to monitor air quality and traffic safety, integrating STEM learning with 
community mobility problem-solving. 

 

• Retrain America & Southwest Public Schools West Campus – All Things PAT3 
 
Expanding air quality and mobility data projects with drones to foster STEM 
education and environmental awareness. 
 

• h.u.e. technology – h.u.e. technology Mobile Technology Training 
 
Offering training in mobile networking, disaster recovery, cybersecurity, and EV 
charging station maintenance. 
 

• h.u.e. technology – ChargeIT EV Mobile Charging Trailer Pt. 2 
 
Completing a mobile EV charging trailer for disaster response and first responder 
support. 
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• Eight Million Stories, Inc. – Sons of Promise Program: EV Exploration 
 
Providing hands-on EV education, field trips, and career exploration for middle and 
high school students in Sunnyside, Fifth Ward, and Gulfton. 
 

• Rock Solid Ingenuity LLC – Veteran Owned EV Chargers 
 
Installing EV chargers to reduce emissions, expand charging access, and support 
community EV adoption. 
 

• ScottysBikes– UL Bike Upgrade 
 
Expanding access to electric mobility by purchasing e-bikes for residents in 77020 
and surrounding neighborhoods. 
 

• Greater First Baptist Church – GFB EV Charging Station 
 
Installing an EV charging station and generator to serve the church campus and 
surrounding community. 
 

• BikeHouston Inc. – E-Bike Incentive Rebate Program 
 
Offering e-bike purchase rebates to make clean transportation more affordable for 
Houstonians. 

 

• Pangea Charging & Vallabh Priti Seva Samaj – EV Charging at VPSS Temple 
 
Installing Level 2 EV chargers at a community temple to expand access to clean 
transportation. 
 

• Sumn Inc. – Sumn Micro-mobility Initiative 
 
Adding 10 e-bikes for a community share program serving The Plant/Harrisburg 
Lofts/East End District. 
 

• TT Innovative Solutions– The Road Ahead: EV Mobility 
 
Hosting hands-on EcoMobility workshops on EV affordability, sustainability, and 
green job opportunities. 
 

Congratulations to all of our Round 3 grantees for their leadership, innovation, and 

commitment to advancing clean transportation in Houston. Together, this collaborative 

network is powering a more equitable, sustainable transportation future for all Houstonians. 


